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Saviance Technologies awarded as a 

Top 100 Diversity Owned Business in New Jersey, US 
 

This program by DiversityBusiness.com recognizes and honors individuals who have 

established themselves as a world class community of entrepreneurs 

 

 

NEW JERSEY (April 28, 2014) – Saviance Technologies, a US based Healthcare technology 

services company has recently been awarded by DiversityBusiness.com as one of the Top 

100 Diversity Owned Businesses in New Jersey, US. 

 

Established in 1999 by DiversityBusiness.com, the “Top Business List” is part of its ongoing 

commitment to remain at the forefront in championing the entrepreneurial spirit. This 

prestigious list offers the most comprehensive look at the strongest segment of the United 

States economy - America's privately held companies. These companies are the most 

recognized and respected which truly differentiate themselves in our indeterminate market 

place. This esteemed list has been highly coveted by corporations, government agencies and 

educational institutions who desire to increase opportunities with diversity-owned businesses. 
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Commenting on this recognition, Rohit Mahajan, President & CEO, Saviance 

Technologies said, “It is an honor to be listed among the prestigious Top 100 Diversity 

Owned Businesses in NJ. This will not only open up a lot of doors of opportunity for us but 

will also boost the respect and reputation we have earned over the past 14 years as an 

accomplished and innovative organization.” 

 

Over 1.3 million businesses participate in this annual survey. The "Top Businesses" are 

determined by a selection committee which evaluates the eligibility for all submissions in 

each award category. The selection committee bases their decision on a set of criteria which 

includes: reviewing each entrant’s business profile, website and gross annual sales submitted. 

The goal each year of the "Top Businesses in America" program is to continue to celebrate 

another year of innovation, progression and growth and to raise the profile of entrepreneurs 

who remain committed in strengthening our competitive global landscape and rebuilding our 

future. 

 

Saviance has been recognized by DiversityBusiness.com as a result of its comprehensive 

Healthcare IT Services & Solutions, which enables Saviance to serve its distinguished clients 

achieve critical objectives such as improved knowledge management, enhanced technological 

prowess, improved productivity, better return on investment and the ability to make value-

added business decisions.  

_________________________________________________________________________ 

 
ABOUT Saviance Technologies: Saviance is a US based Healthcare IT Services provider 
focusing on the newest technology SMAC stack – Social, Mobility, Analytics & Cloud.	
  We 
provide innovative solutions & enable meaningful use of IT by designing patient 
engagement portals, collaboration applications & actionable analytics for wellness & 
population health. Incorporated in 1999 in the US, with over 14 years of excellent industry 
track record, Saviance offers services & solutions that enable enterprises to achieve critical 
objectives.  
 
Saviance is a Gold Category Corporate Member with Healthcare Information Management 
Systems Society (HIMSS), member of mHealth Alliance and Corporate member of NJ-
HITEC. We are awarded by INC. 5000 as one of the fastest growing privately held 
companies in North America. Saviance is also ranked among the Fast 50 Asian American 
Businesses in the United States by USPAACC (US Pan Asian American Chamber of 
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Commerce) and selected as a 2014 "Top Business" recipient by DiversityBusiness.com. A 
certified Minority Business Enterprise recognized by NMSDC, Saviance is also partner with 
leading global brands such as Microsoft, Amazon Web Services, Apple, Samsung and Red 
Hat. 
 
Visit us: www.facebook.com/SavianceTechnologies  
Follow Us: www.twitter.com/SavianceT  
Website: www.saviance.com 	
  
	
  
__________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
ABOUT:  
Launched in 1999, DiversityBusiness is the largest organization of privately owned 
businesses throughout the United States that provide goods and services to Fortune 1000 
companies, government agencies, and colleges and universities. DiversityBusiness provides 
research and data collection services for diversity including the "Top 50 Organizations for 
Multicultural Business Opportunities", "Top 500 Diversity Owned Companies in America", 
and others. Its research has been recognized and published by Forbes Magazine, Business 
Week and thousands of other print and internet publications. The site has gained national 
recognition and has won numerous awards for its content and design. Its e-magazine reaches 
over 3,000,000 readers, an e-newsletter that reaches 2.4 million, and website visitors of 1.2 
million a month. It is a leading provider of diversity management tools. 
DiversityBusiness.com is produced by Computer Consulting Associates International Inc. 
(CCAii.com) of Southport, CT. Founded in 1980. 
 
	
  
  
 


